
5782/2022: Giving Voice to the Light 

Job 22:28  Thou shalt also decree a thing, and it shall be established unto 
thee: and the light shall shine upon thy ways.  

 

1. Abba Father forgive me for the careless words that I have spoken over the 

last year.  

Mat 12:37  For by thy words thou shalt be justified, and by thy words thou shalt be 
condemned.  

 

2. Forgive me for the things that I have said about myself that were not in-

line with your plan for my life.  

Jer 29:11  For I know the thoughts that I think toward you, saith the LORD, thoughts of 
peace, and not of evil, to give you an expected end.  

 

3. I repent for allowing the enemy to use my mouth to speak word curses 

against others and come into agreement with darkness.  

Rev 12:10  And I heard a loud voice saying in heaven, Now is come salvation, and 
strength, and the kingdom of our God, and the power of his Christ: for the accuser of our 
brethren is cast down, which accused them before our God day and night.  

Rev 12:11 And they overcame him by the blood of the Lamb, and by the word of their 

testimony; and they loved not their lives unto the death. 

 

4. Forgive me for the things that I have spoken over my children, my 

spouse, my family and friends that were not a part of your plan for their 

lives.  

Psa 112:1  Praise ye the LORD. Blessed is the man that feareth the LORD, that delighteth 
greatly in his commandments.  

Psa 112:2  His seed shall be mighty upon earth: the generation of the upright shall be 
blessed.  

Psa 112:3  Wealth and riches shall be in his house: and his righteousness endureth for 
ever.  

Psa 112:4  Unto the upright there ariseth light in the darkness: he is gracious, and full of 
compassion, and righteous.  

Psa 112:5  A good man sheweth favour, and lendeth: he will guide his affairs with 
discretion.  

Psa 112:6  Surely he shall not be moved for ever: the righteous shall be in everlasting 
remembrance.  

Psa 112:7 He shall not be afraid of evil tidings: his heart is fixed, trusting in the LORD 



 

5. Forgive me for giving voice to that is darkness instead of which is Light. 

Psa 1:1  Blessed is the man that walketh not in the counsel of the ungodly, nor standeth 
in the way of sinners, nor sitteth in the seat of the scornful.  

Psa 1:2  But his delight is in the law of the LORD; and in his law doth he meditate day 
and night.  

Psa 1:3 And he shall be like a tree planted by the rivers of water, that bringeth forth his 

fruit in his season; his leaf also shall not wither; and whatsoever he doeth shall prosper. 

6. Purify my heart and mind.  

Psa 51:10  Create in me a clean heart, O God; and renew a right spirit within me.  

 

7. I pray the fire of the Holy Ghost will cleanse my tongue cause me to speak 

Your words and not my opinions.  

Isa 6:5  Then said I, Woe is me! for I am undone; because I am a man of unclean lips, 
and I dwell in the midst of a people of unclean lips: for mine eyes have seen the King, 
the LORD of hosts.  

Isa 6:6  Then flew one of the seraphims unto me, having a live coal in his hand, which he 
had taken with the tongs from off the altar:  

Isa 6:7 And he laid it upon my mouth, and said, Lo, this hath touched thy lips; and thine 

iniquity is taken away, and thy sin purged.  

 

8. Grant me the grace to speak the Light.  

Psa 119:129  Thy testimonies are wonderful: therefore doth my soul keep them.  

Psa 119:130 The entrance of thy words giveth light; it giveth understanding unto the 

simple. 

 

9. Renew my mind with your Word so that only Your words flow from my 

mouth.  

Rom 12:2 And be not conformed to this world: but be ye transformed by the renewing of 

your mind, that ye may prove what is that good, and acceptable, and perfect, will of God. 

 

10. I pray the Holy Spirit makes me aware when I am about to say 

something that is not Your will.  According to Psalm 141:3 “put a guard over 

my mouth and set watch over the doors of my lips”.  Bring a heavy 

conviction over me when I am getting ready to say the wrong thing and let 

me quickly be repentant and make it right.  



Psa 141:3 (AMP)  Set a guard, O Lord, before my mouth; keep watch at the door of my 
lips.  

Psa 141:4 (AMP)  Incline my heart not to submit or consent to any evil thing or to be 
occupied in deeds of wickedness with men who work iniquity; and let me not eat of their 
dainties.  

Psa 141:5 (AMP) Let the righteous man smite and correct me--it is a kindness. Oil so 

choice let not my head refuse or discourage; for even in their evils or calamities shall my 

prayer continue. 

11. Now Lord I pray that you cancel every evil declaration that I have 

released into the atmosphere.  

Num 23:19  God is not a man; he will not lie. God is not a human being; his decisions 
will not change. If he says he will do something, then he will do it. If he makes a 
promise, then he will do what he promised.  

Num 23:20  He told me to bless them. He blessed them, so I cannot change that.  

Num 23:21  God saw no wrong in Jacob's people. He saw no sin in the Israelites. The 
LORD is their God, and he is with them. The Great King is with them!  

Num 23:22  God brought them out of Egypt. They are as strong as a wild ox.  

Num 23:23 There is no power that can defeat the people of Jacob. There is no magic that 

can stop the Israelites. People will say this about Jacob and the Israelites: 'Look at the 

great things God did!'  

12. I do not want to eat the fruit of death from my lips. I pray these words 

come to nothing.  

Pro 18:20  A man's belly shall be satisfied with the fruit of his mouth; and with the 
increase of his lips shall he be filled.  

Pro 18:21 Death and life are in the power of the tongue: and they that love it shall eat the 

fruit thereof.  

13. Cause my mind to reflect on things that are true, pure, lovely, praise-

worthy, good, uplifting, honest and peaceful.  

Php 4:8  Finally, brethren, whatsoever things are true, whatsoever things are honest, 
whatsoever things are just, whatsoever things are pure, whatsoever things are lovely, 
whatsoever things are of good report; if there be any virtue, and if there be any praise, 
think on these things.  

 

14.  Give me a new mindset, Your mindset. Change my perspective. With so 

much bad in this world let me see the positive in all situations and speak 

that instead of what is negative, I trust You Holy Spirit to keep me 

accountable.  

Rom 8:26  Likewise the Spirit also helpeth our infirmities: for we know not what we 
should pray for as we ought: but the Spirit itself maketh intercession for us with 
groanings which cannot be uttered.  



Rom 8:27 And he that searcheth the hearts knoweth what is the mind of the Spirit, 

because he maketh intercession for the saints according to the will of God. 

 

 15. Minister to my spirit what You would like created in the world and let 

me create that with my mouth, in Jesus name, Amen. 

Jos 1:8 This book of the law shall not depart out of thy mouth; but thou shalt meditate 

therein day and night, that thou mayest observe to do according to all that is written 

therein: for then thou shalt make thy way prosperous, and then thou shalt have good 

success.  
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